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From Face-to-Face to Virtual Instruction: Developing Competencies to 
Administer a Standardized Assessment During COVID-19 
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Abstract 
The public health response to the COVID-19 

pandemic necessitated that face-to-face (F2F) 
teaching and learning strategies be adapted to the 
virtual environment. This article describes a 7-
step method successfully used to rapidly adapt an 
established and valid 4- to 6-week F2F training 
program into a 10-week virtual format for pro-
spective SIS-A assessors to develop assessment 
competencies. Strategies used to validate the 
adapted curriculum, instructional materials, in-
structional strategies, and guidance materials are 
discussed, as are the perspectives of the inaugu-
ral virtual training cohort. The evidence for and 
implications of greater adoption of technology in 
social work teaching, learning, and practice are 
considered. 

 
Keywords: training, virtual, adapt, assess-

ment, technology, SIS-A, supports  
 

Introduction 
 

While online learning has increased dramati-
cally for social work students (Dillingham & 
Mitchell, 2019; Gibson & Carroll, 2019) and 
professionals (Ausbrooks & Travis, 2017; Lam-
bert, 2020), the COVID-19 pandemic of 2020 
accelerated the adoption of virtual mechanisms 
to provide preservice training and professional 
development in the field (Kourgiantakis & Lee, 
2020). The technological transformation of social 
work education had begun taking shape prior to 
the pandemic (Campbell, Lucio, & Abel, 2019) 
with the acknowledgement of emerging best 
practices to virtually engage learners and achieve 
learning goals (Farrel et al., 2018). Broadly, the 
strategies for virtual education are either syn-
chronous—that is, occurring in real time, with 
the possibility of live student–instructor interac-
tion—or asynchronous—that is, taking place 
through learning activities in which instructors 
and students are not simultaneously present. In 
their meta-analysis, Farrel et al. (2018) reported 
that there is substantial evidence that virtual edu-
cation is optimized by integrating both strategies, 

with asynchronous activities providing opportuni-
ties to reflect, analyze, and apply new knowledge 
and synchronous activities offering occasions to 
motivate and engage students and promote critical 
thinking. 

 
The Council on Social Work Education’s 

(CSWE) educational and accreditation standards 
describe the core competences that all social 
workers must have (CSWE, 2015). Several stud-
ies have demonstrated (a) the efficacy of virtual 
education in developing these core social worker 
competencies (Joiner, 2018; McCulloch, Cuckler, 
Valdes, & Hughes, 2020), (b) the advantages of 
team teaching (Camp & Egbert, 2018), and (c) 
what strategies create a feeling of cohesion 
among students in distance education (Miles, 
Mensingan, & Zuchowski, 2018).  

 
Virtual training can be effective in promoting 

mastery of new and complex material. Moskaliuk, 
Bertram, and Cress (2013) demonstrated that vir-
tual training can effectively support knowledge 
acquisition for complex tasks that require team 
collaboration. Fairburn, Allen, Bailey-Straebler, 
O’Connor, and Cooper (2017) demonstrated that 
clinicians can gain new competencies through 
web-based training, and the American Associa-
tion on Intellectual and Developmental Disabili-
ties (AAIDD) demonstrated that social workers 
and other disability professionals who were 
trained virtually to administer a support-need as-
sessment remotely performed assessments with 
equivalent fidelity and reliability to those who 
received face-to-face (F2F) training and per-
formed the assessment F2F (Thompson, Carlson, 
& Shaw, 2020).  

 
Assessment Tool 

 
AAIDD is the oldest and largest professional 

association concerned with intellectual and devel-
opmental disabilities. Through its three peer-
reviewed journals, catalog of books and assessment 
tools, and educational programs, AAIDD engages 
its multidisciplinary members, the public, and other 
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leaders within the disability community on issues 
that are important to people with disabilities and 
their families. One assessment tool published by 
AAIDD is the Supports Intensity Scale–Adult 
Version® (SIS-A®; Thompson et al., 2015). The 
SIS-A is a valid, reliable, standardized, and wide-
ly used assessment tool designed to measure and 
describe the pattern and intensity of supports that 
a person with intellectual and developmental disa-
bilities (IDD) age 16 years or older needs to be 
successful in community settings. The assessment 
is performed via a semi-structured interview with 
at least two people who know the individual well 
(respondents); the individual with IDD is encour-
aged to participate in the interview, which typical-
ly takes 2 to 3 hours to complete, and results in a 
quantitative profile of supports across six life do-
mains. Collectively, scores from these six do-
mains provide a composite standard score which 
identifies the individual’s level or intensity of 
support needs. The SIS-A also collects important, 
but not standardized, information about any (a) 
exceptional medical and behavioral issues and (b) 
strategies used to advocate for and protect them-
selves.  

 
Each year, approximately 46,000 SIS-A as-

sessments are conducted by more than 700 quali-
fied assessors across 21 U.S. states and Canadian 
provinces. One motivation for jurisdictions to 
conduct large-scale assessment programs is to 
create “an evidenced-informed and logically de-
fensible basis for estimating the distribution of 
public funds (i.e., resource allocation) that are 
available to provide services and supports for 
people with IDD” (Thompson, Schalock, and 
Tassé, 2018, p. 3). AAIDD provides its standard-
ized SIS-A assessment training at the invitation of 
jurisdictions (states or provinces) or agencies 
while incorporating references to their unique 
acronyms, systems, and policies. 

 
The SIS-A is a tool that meets the require-

ments for periodic, evidence-based assessment of 
individuals for Medicaid-funded services. Sho-
gren, Thompson, Shaw, Grandfield, and Hagiwa-
ra (2018) have demonstrated the stability of SIS-
A scores across a two- to three-year period in 
adults with intellectual and developmental disa-
bilities. AAIDD recommends that individuals 
should be reassessed approximately every three 
years unless substantial changes in the person’s 

life would prompt a reassessment of support need; 
and in the years between assessments, support 
needs should continue to be monitored and docu-
mented. Because SIS-A scores, in conjunction 
with other variables, may be used in making fund-
ing decisions that may span one or more years, it 
is vital that the assessments are properly per-
formed and that reassessments occur on time or in 
response to substantial life changes.  

 
To assure that SIS-A assessments provide reli-

able measures of support needs, prospective as-
sessors must complete and pass a standardized 
training protocol developed and copyrighted by 
AAIDD. The training protocol is designed to 
build discrete competencies in assessment and use 
of the tool itself through group classroom-style 
instruction, study of material review, small-group 
guided practice in use of the assessment, inde-
pendent practice, and performance of an assess-
ment with sufficient skill and fidelity to receive a 
qualification level (novice, beginner, qualified, or 
advanced). In addition, all SIS assessors must 
requalify annually to maintain their recognition as 
qualified assessors. 

 
To maintain a cadre of sufficient size to meet 

the needs of states and provinces for qualified 
assessors, each year approximately 350 new as-
sessors must be trained, and all other assessors 
requalified. All SIS-A trainings, annual requalifi-
cations, and assessments were performed entirely 
F2F prior to the pandemic; however, the inadvisa-
bility of F2F activities following the COVID out-
break in early 2020 created an urgent need to piv-
ot SIS-A training and assessment practices. To 
ensure that an adequate number of qualified as-
sessors continued to be available to jurisdictions, 
AAIDD needed to rapidly develop, implement, 
and validate an effective virtual instructional pro-
gram to build discrete competencies among pro-
spective assessors and to develop guidelines for 
standardized, remotely conducted SIS-A assess-
ments. 

 
F2F Training Program 

 
The F2F assessor training program consists of 

interactive group and individual educational ses-
sions presented in three phases—orientation, 
guided practice, and qualification—conducted 
over 4 to 6 weeks; the training schedule is influ-
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enced by variables such as the size of the training 
cohort, trainer availability, holidays, and inclem-
ent weather. The size of the cohort drives the 
number of trainers used; team teaching is used 
with a cohort of 15 or more. The learning goals 
are to develop prospective assessors’ knowledge 
and competencies to ensure that they will accu-
rately perform the standardized assessments. The 
benefit of developing and deploying competent 
and qualified assessors is that reliable SIS data 
can be gathered, which may then be used to 
meaningfully inform support planning at the indi-
vidual level and inform funding decisions at the 
jurisdictional level. 

 
Phase I (Orientation) is conducted in a class-

room setting using lectures and small-group activ-
ities across three days. Instruction for the first two 
days introduces (a) content and the philosophy 
and values underpinning the concept of support 
need and (b) standardized assessment administra-
tion protocols. The third day uses small-group 
activities to apply new knowledge and promote 
the development of competencies in standardized 
assessment. 

 
Phase II (Guided Practice) is conducted on a 

one-to-one or small group-basis in 4-hour-long 
sessions to prepare trainees to conduct independ-
ent practice assessments, generally over 1 to 2 
weeks. Coaching is used to develop effective 
communication styles, assessment skills, and in-
terview techniques and to instill accuracy in scor-
ing and score interpretation. Participants take 
turns administering elements of the assessment, 
followed by a debriefing session for trainees to 
reflect, ask questions, and anchor their new 
knowledge and insights. Following this phase, 2 
to 3 weeks are set aside for trainees to conduct at 
least four independent practice interviews to gain 
experience with a greater diversity of interview 
scenarios and respondents. One-to-one coaching 
is provided via email or conference call.  

 
Phase III (Qualification) consists of a 4-hour 

session that includes a 1-hour-long preliminary 
one-to-one coaching session with the trainer to 
address any concerns or questions that arose dur-
ing the independent practice assessments and to 
clarify the expectations and requirements for suc-
cessful performance on the final evaluation. Fol-
lowing the coaching, the trainee then inde-

pendently administers the assessment under ob-
servation and participates in a debrief where the 
trainer reviews their observations on the assess-
ment and provides their evaluation of the compe-
tencies demonstrated by the trainee.  

 
Broadly, the competencies required for quali-

fication to administer SIS-A assessments are the 
demonstration of (a) effective and appropriate 
interview techniques and facilitation skills and 
use of ratings, core concepts, and assessment me-
chanics and (b) proficiency in eliciting valid and 
reliable data from respondents and facilitating 
inter-respondent agreement on individual items. 
Following the completion of Phase III, assessors 
may be qualified at the novice, beginner, quali-
fied, or advanced levels. 

 
Method 

 
The training program described above was 

rapidly adapted from an F2F to a virtual format 
using a seven-step process that included input 
from content experts, multi-pronged validation of 
software, curriculum modification, and newly 
developed instructional materials. Steps 1–5 were 
accomplished in only 4 weeks. The reliability and 
validity of the assessments conducted remotely by 
those trained virtually were established through 
an independent study (Thompson et al., 2020). 
The steps and strategies used to adapt the training 
program are described below.  

 
Step 1: Planning and Decision-Making 

The training team first developed an overarch-
ing project plan and timeline to guide the work of 
adapting the F2F training and launching the virtu-
al training. The team responsible for the F2F 
training program held a series of meetings to de-
termine how to adapt the program’s essential 
training activities to the virtual environment. 
First, the team considered and determined the 
optional virtual instructional strategies for the 
program, including adjustments to the curriculum 
timeline, introduction of team teaching, and adap-
tation of instructional materials. The team deter-
mined that the virtual training program could be 
delivered in 10 weeks (the F2F program is deliv-
ered over a 4- to 6-week period). Next, the team 
considered various learning management systems 
(LMSs), video-conferencing platforms, and in-
structional design modules and identified the best 
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fits to support the virtual training program. Final-
ly, the initial plan for the delivery of the virtual 
training program was reviewed and revised to 
accommodate the evolving COVID-related con-
cerns.  

 
Step 2: Establishing Ease of Use  

The LMS selected for the virtual training, 
Schoology, was chosen for its accessibility, utili-
ty, and success in schools and higher education 
institutions. In addition, Schoology supports team 
teaching, offers multiple learning delivery modal-
ities, and can track attendance, grading, and noti-
fications. Tutorial mock-ups and resources were 
uploaded to the LMS, and its features were tested 
from the perspective of trainees and determined 
by the training team to be easy to use. Manage-
ment personnel from the agency that would be the 
first recipient of the virtual training program were 
also recruited to test the LMS for its ease of use. 
The agency staff’s independent confirmation of 
the LMS’s ease of use validated the choice of the 
platform for use with prospective assessors.  

 
Step 3: Transforming Instructional and Con-
tent Delivery 

The F2F curriculum, materials, and education-
al strategies have resulted in the production of 
highly qualified and reliable assessors (Thompson 
et al., 2015). The five-phase ADDIE (analyze, 
design, develop, implement, evaluate) instruction-
al design model (Patel, Margolies, Covell, Lip-
scomb, & Dixon, 2018), influential in the F2F 
training, was used as a framework to adapt and 
optimize the instructional strategies and materials 
for the virtual environment. In addition, the AD-
DIE framework was used to respond to the virtual 
training needs of prospective trainees, many of 
whom verbalized a preference for F2F training 
and a lack of self-confidence with virtual learn-
ing, as reported by agency management staff. The 
ADDIE instructional design model was supple-
mented with the additions of “Peace Rooms” (like 
group office hours) and small group sessions. 

 
Anderson, Airasian, Cruikshank, and Raths 

(2001) suggested that to maintain trainees’ con-
tinued engagement in learning across a 10-week 
period, significant adaptations to training content 
and its presentation would be essential. Examples 
of adaptations include additional reading materi-
als and demonstration videos and the introduction 

of knowledge check-ins after each training mod-
ule.   

 
Step 4: Developing Guidance Documents  

The team developed new guidance documents 
and scripts to introduce the LMS to trainees and 
to increase the comfort of both trainees and re-
spondents with the video-conferencing platform 
(Zoom). Zoom was selected as a matter of con-
venience; AAIDD already had the platform li-
censes and trainees were at least familiar with the 
software through their employer. Examples of 
these documents include an introduction script, an 
assessor checklist for guided practices and qualifi-
cations, and guidance for conducting virtual inter-
views. On the basis of their individual experienc-
es as trainers, training team members determined 
that guidance documents would be helpful to (a) 
clarify and define frequently used terms distin-
guishing different interview formats (in-person, 
virtual, remote) and communication modes (video 
conference, teleconference, online platforms) and 
(b) guide document sharing; scheduling; prepara-
tion of respondents for the virtual structured inter-
view; and ensure the performance of assessor 
tasks before, during, and after the interview. Fol-
lowing the development of draft guidance docu-
ments, feedback and validation on their clarity, 
appropriateness, and likely usefulness were se-
cured from a cohort of recently trained assessors.  

 
Step 5: Orienting the Inaugural Cohort of Vir-
tual Trainees  

Prior to introduction of the curriculum, in-
structors facilitated a 2-hour orientation webinar 
to review Schoology and Zoom platforms; engage 
trainees; and prepare trainees for the program’s 
10-week, three-phase virtual training program. 

  
Step 6: Delivering the Inaugural Training Pro-
gram 

A group introductory meeting was held at the 
beginning of each training phase, and a weekly 
Peace Room meeting provided a forum for train-
ees to clarify their understanding of content and 
techniques. The Peace Room also promoted en-
gagement, social interaction, and cohort cohesion. 
The virtual training program’s phases are de-
scribed below. 

 
Phase 1: Orientation. Phase 1 was delivered 

across a 2-week period. For Week 1, the entire 
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cohort attended two 2-hour-long instructional 
presentations each day of the workweek. For 
Week 2, the cohort broke into small groups; each 
small group met for two 2-hour-long interactive 
and experiential learning sessions each day of the 
week.  

 
Phase 2: Guided practice. Phase 2 was deliv-

ered across a 3-week period. The training team 
scheduled two or three guided practice sessions 
each weekday for small groups. For each 2½-hour 
guided practice session, the instructor coached 
trainees to develop their skills and competencies 
in conducting virtual SIS-A assessments. Be-
tween Phases 2 and 3, trainees were required to 
complete at least four independent practice as-
sessments with the SIS-A.  

 
Phase 3: Qualification. Phase 3 was delivered 

across a 4-week period, with a similar schedule 
and format to Phase 2. In Phase 3, each trainee 
conducted a virtual SIS-A assessment inde-
pendently while observed and rated by a trainer, 
who then debriefed the trainee and awarded them 
their qualification level. Preliminary group meet-
ings and debriefs were included with each train-
ing phase.  

 
Step 7: Evaluating the Training 
A post-training evaluation survey was com-

pleted by trainees (with a 97% response rate), 
validating the effectiveness of several adaptations 
made for the virtual format. The 40-person train-
ing cohort consisted of social workers and other 
disability professionals, of which 32 were new 
trainees, five were previously trained assessors, 
and three were management representatives of the 
agency. Thirty-six (90%) trainees identified their 
role as being assessors, 5% identified as manag-
ers, and 5% did not respond. Within the cohort, 
73% identified as female, 15% as male, and 12% 
did not report a gender. Thirty-eight percent 
(38%) were between the ages of 25 and 34 years, 
38% were between ages 35 and 44, 21% were 
between ages 45 and 54, and 3% were over age 
55 or did not report an age. Regarding their high-
est level of education, 69% reported holding a 
bachelor’s degree, and 31% reported holding a 
master’s degree. 

 
Post-training survey responses overwhelming-

ly endorsed satisfaction with (a) pretraining activ-

ities, where 82% found communication of train-
ing goals and objectives before the start of the 
course helpful; (b) course structure, where 71% 
found the course’s flow and sequences and sepa-
ration between course phases to be helpful; and 
(c) their engagement in the training phases: Ori-
entation (79%), Guided Practice (89%), and Qual-
ification (92%). The majority of respondents 
(over 80%) approved of the course content and 
course delivery mechanisms, and over 90% of 
respondents rated the skills of the instructors to be 
good or excellent. While over 75% of respondents 
indicated that the LMS was easy to use, a notable 
62% reported they did not care for the amount of 
time spent learning to use the LMS platform. Re-
sponses to two open-ended questions on what was 
most- and least-liked in the virtual training pro-
gram confirmed the quantitative responses: re-
spondents overwhelmingly favored trainers’ 
knowledge, skills, and qualities, and indicated a 
dislike of learning how to use Zoom and Schoolo-
gy. 

 
A four-part question asked respondents to re-

flect on any differences between their expecta-
tions and the reality of the learning experience. 
Interestingly, while 17% of trainees indicated that 
they would not take another virtual course, 92% 
reported that they achieved the program’s overall 
learning goals, 92% reported that their knowledge 
and skills had improved because of the course, 
and 74% reported that their expectations were 
fulfilled.  

 
Finally, the qualification rates from this virtual 

training program were compared with those of a 
F2F training program performed in 2017 with a 
similar training cohort employed by the same 
agency. The qualification distribution levels 
(novice, beginner, qualified, or advanced) and 
qualification rates from the virtual and F2F train-
ings were nearly identical (93% and 94%, respec-
tively). Although not evaluated, the confidence of 
trainees in their ability to conduct the SIS-A as-
sessment itself, regardless of the training format, 
is assumed to reflect their resultant qualification 
level. While this one example is not sufficient to 
draw any conclusions, the consistency of the 
qualification rates observed across the training 
formats seems promising. 

 
It is also interesting to note that informal feed-
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back from trainers indicated that their transition 
from F2F teaching to a virtual teaching was more 
time intensive than anticipated as it required them 
to master virtual teaching strategies, become fa-
miliar with virtual teaching aids, and more inten-
tionally manage their own time and self-care in 
response to the demands of learners who were 
less confident in a virtual training environment. 
Trainers also reported finding teaching online to 
be more stressful than F2F and noted difficulties 
in setting and respecting self-imposed boundaries 
for “quitting time.” 

 
Discussion 

 
There is a growing body of literature on the 

use of technology in social work education. The 
implementation and initial outcomes of this rapid 
adaptation of an F2F training program into a vir-
tual format represents an early implementation of 
the growing evidence base. The seven-step adap-
tation process described here resulted in a virtual 
training program that built discrete competencies 
among prospective assessors. Some reflections on 
the use of technology for effective teaching, 
learning, and practice, and the practical implica-
tions for social workers and others, are as follows:  
 In the virtual training environment, as with 

F2F teaching, learning styles vary widely, 
and some trainees will require more individu-
alized teaching strategies than will others to 
achieve desired leaning outcomes. To sustain 
trainee engagement and accommodate differ-
ent learning styles, a variety of instructional 
activities and techniques are essential to the 
effective delivery of virtual training. In addi-
tion, as in F2F training, a variety of strategies 
are needed in the virtual environment to sup-
port trainees in mastering complex content 
and demonstrating competencies.  

 Synchronous instructional activities, in addi-
tion to their proven techniques to transfer 
knowledge and build rapport, are valuable in 
maintaining constancy across episodes of 
asynchronous learning. In particular, the 
small-group instruction and debriefings and 
the Peace Room described in this adaptation 
were beneficial in preventing or redirecting 
learning drift among trainees. 

 The virtual training environment can be 
structured to effectively model and coach 

competencies. As described above, easily 
available electronic platforms were used to 
develop competencies in engagement, facili-
tation, professionalism, professional judg-
ment, and critical thinking among trainees in 
the virtual environment. 

 Team teaching is particularly suited to the 
virtual environment; not only does an instruc-
tional team offer greater flexibility in sched-
uling small-group and one-to-one activities, 
but the approach is also scalable. The sched-
ule of the training program can be easily 
maintained with small and large cohorts alike 
by adjusting the number of trainers, thus 
maintaining a low trainee-to-trainer ratio and 
advancing trainees’ investment and involve-
ment in their own learning process. 

 Virtual teaching formats have the potential to 
lead to instructor burnout unless the parame-
ters for trainee engagement are clarified. In 
particular, trainers and trainees must have the 
same expectations for instructor access and 
availability (a) to respond to emails and 
schedule group meetings, (b) for the length of 
individual debrief sessions, and (c) to provide 
“help-desk”-level technical support to learn-
ers. 

 
Conclusion 

 
In the aftermath of the COVID pandemic, ad-

vancements in—and comfort with—technology 
will continue to evolve. By the end of this decade, 
there is no doubt that technological innovations 
will significantly change the ways in which we 
teach, learn, and practice. While this note from 
the field describes the successful rapid adaptation 
of an existing curriculum, the next stage of in-
quiry might be to identify successful strategies for 
building entirely new curricula in the virtual envi-
ronment.  
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